
 
 

Ops Update: War on Tamarisk 

Tamarisk Times 

Schedule for Today: 

 7:00 AM—Breakfast Starts 

 8:30 AM—Most Religious 

Services 

 10:00 AM—Bus Loading Ex-

ercise followed by Crew 

and Squad Pictures 

 12:00 PM—Lunch! 

 12:00 PM—Trading Post 

Open 

 1:00 PM—Afternoon Training 

 5:15 PM—Catholic Mass 

 5:30 PM—Dinner Shift 1 

 6:15 PM—Dinner Shift 2 

 7:00 PM—Recreation Activi-

ties 

 10:00 PM—Lights Out 
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Huntington grows 

Yesterday the most inte-

gral ingredient to our 

service project arrived: 

the Participants! 

A Scout is Reverent 

 Interfaith Services: held at 8:30 AM under the shade shelter 

on the lawn east of the school 

 Protestant Services: held at 8:30 AM in the gym 

 The Church of Jesus Christ Latter-day Saints: Sacrament 

Meeting held at 8:30 AM inside the school in tiered seating 

just past registration 

 Catholic Mass: held at 5:15 PM at San Rafael Mission 3.3 

Miles south of the school. If possible please provide own 

transportation (see Registration desk for directions). If you 

need a ride meet at the flagpole in front of the school no 

later than 5:00 PM. 

Today is the beginning of 

an event of epic propor-

tions.  We will be training 

you on today on the ICS 

command system, Leave No 

Trace, Safety and Tama-

risk Education.   

Below you will find a copy 

of the schedule for the 

afternoon training.  This 

training will be the basis 

from which our project 

will build throughout the 

week. 

Remember the Opera-

tions slogan “Kill The 

Tamarisk!!” 



not be permitted on the worksite 
due to their tendencies to dehy-
drate rather than hydrate. Work 
to rest ratios will also be moni-
tored and enforced to help make 
sure that we all have an enjoya-
ble both 
while work-
ing on-site 
and during 
recreation.  

 

Don’t under-
estimate the 
impact that 
heat and 
dehydration 
can play on 
our perfor-
mance on-
site. By work-
ing together 
and watching 
out for each 
other we can 
help to en-
sure that 
EVERY per-
son can get 
through the 

The potential for heat injuries 
among participants and staff at 
Manti-La Sal will be extreme this 
year. The majority of our work at 
Buckhorn wash will be within the 
walls of a desert canyon. The 
rocks will reflect and hold heat 
while reducing the possibility of 
air. Shade while available will be 
limited. Nobody wants to go out 
on their first day and end up out 
of commission for the rest of the 
week due to sunburn, heat 
cramps, heat exhaustion or heat 
stroke.  

 

Typically, while we all know that 
sunblock is something we should 
use when outdoors during the 
summertime, often, we neglect 
this simple measure and pay the 
price later. Be sure that you are 
using nothing less than SPF 30 
(Preferably higher) sunblock. 
Additionally, you can expect a 
VERY HIGH emphasis placed on 
hydration. Squad Leaders will be 
mandated to ensure that work 
crews are drinking plenty of wa-
ter. Carbonated beverages will 

week without a heat or hydration 
related injury. 

Newsflash from Safety: It’s Hot! 

Camera Uploading 

Available! 

Are you taking pictures? 

Please help out our staff by 

uploading copies of your 

photos into our documenta-

tion system at Dinner at the 

Camera Table! 

Tamarisk Times 
June 15th, 2008 Issue 3 

Today’s Trading Post 

Hours: 12:00 pm—1:00 pm 

 6:15 pm—10:00 pm 

Participant Guide 

Update! 
The Emergency Phone Num-

ber on Page Four of the Par-

ticipant Guide is Incorrect! 

And that’s why it’s been 

crossed out in deep black. 

The number you should use 

for EMERGENCY’S ONLY is 

(435) 687-2922 

Parking! 
I like to move it move it! You like 

to move it move it! Actually, I’d 

like You to move your vehicle away 

from the restricted parking area 

immediately adjacent to the 

school, please. We need the area 

for Forest Service Vehicles and 

other uses! Thank you!! 


